Mott Community College
Board of Trustees

Regular Meeting

Monday, August 23, 2010

Applewood Café
Prahl College Center

AGENDA

“The mission of Mott Community College is to provide high quality, accessible and
affordable educational opportunities and services—including programs focused on
university transfer, technical and lifelong learning, as well as workforce and
economic development—that promote student success, individual development, and
improve the overall quality of life in a multicultural community. ”
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AGENDA
CALL TO ORDER
ADDITIONS TO THE AGENDA
ADOPTION OF THE AGENDA
SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS
Michigan Higher Education Recruitment Consortium
- Mark Kennedy, Chief Human Resources Officer
- Sharon Ewles, Manager, Staffing

Marketing Update
- Michael Kelly, Executive Director, Marketing & Public Relations

COMMUNICATIONS

COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

Approval of Regular Meeting Minutes of June 28, 2010
INFORMATIONAL REPORTS

Acceptance of Standing Board Committee Reports:

1. Personnel (Turner, Faris, Joseph)
2. Finance/Audit (Koegel, Everman, Snell)

UNFINISHED BUSINESS
NEW BUSINESS

Consent Agenda:

1.01  Treasurer’s Report for July 2010 4-8
1.02 Custodial Services for Extension Campuses— Purchase Award 9-10
1.03 Custodial Supplies — Purchase Award 11-13



Individual Items:

1.04  Approval of Administrative Support Collective Bargaining Agreement 14

XI. ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS
President’s Report
XII. MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS
401 Comments from Board Members
XIII. EXECUTIVE SESSION

ADJOURNMENT
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1.01  Treasurer’s Report for July 2010

This resolution is recommended.

Be it Resolved, That
The Charles Stewart Mott Community College Board of Trustees

Accepts the financial report of the College for the month of July 2010 as presented
by the Administration.

Reviewed and Submitted By:

ZMM / W Date: August 13, 2010

Lawrence A. Gawthrop, Chief Finanéiaj Officer

Board Policy Statement Reference: 3100 — Budget Adoption
General: The annual budget represents the programmatic direction and vision of the College. It is also designed to meet
both the legal requirements and needs of the College.



July Treasurer’s Report

Lawrence A. Gawthrop, CPA
Chief Financial Officer
August 13, 2010

Summary of Expenditures:

Month of July Spending:
General Fund: $ 4,548,989
All Other Funds: $ 3,819,660
Total: $ 8,368,649

Comments on General Fund Financial Statements:

e Statement of Revenues, Expenditures and Changes in Net Assets

In summary, total revenues for the one-month period ended July 31, is approximately $10.4 million,
representing 13.7% of the annual budget. This is 3.4% ahead of last year at this time, when we had
recognized 10.3 % of budgeted revenues. Expenditures year-to-date were at $4.5 million dollars,
which represents 6% of the annual budget.

Revenues

Tuition and fee revenues are $9.9 million for the one month ended, an increase of $2.8 million
from last year at this time. This positive variance is mainly due to credit-side enrollment figures for
summer being slightly higher than last year, a 4.3% tuition increase effective in the winter term 2010,
and walk-in fall enrollment opening two weeks earlier than the prior year. The final fall enrollment
will not be known until the final drop/add petiod in mid-September.

Property taxes were $331 thousand for July, and are on pace with the budgeted amounts. We have
budgeted a $2.5 million dectease in total tax collections for the year based on the final taxable value
figures provided to us from the Genesee County Equalization Department.

State appropriations payments for FY2010-11 are paid in monthly installments starting with
October. The total budgeted amount for the current year is $14.5 million which is $464 thousand
lower than the prior year due to a projected 3.1% decrease from the State. It is important to note
that the State of Michigan is still facing budget shortages for their current fiscal year and beyond
which could potentially mean additional cuts to community colleges.

Expenditures
Salaries and wages total $2.0 million for the one month ended July and are consistent with the
prior year. The financial effect of the early retirement incentives will become clearer as the year



progresses.  FPringe benefit expenses which are directly affected by salary increases are at
approximately $1.3 million, up roughly $281 thousand from the previous year.

Other Expenditures

The most significant changes in the Other Expenses area were an increase of approximately $327
thousand in the Operations/communications line item due to an increase in the bad debt write-
offs in July that did not occur in the prior year.

e Balance Sheet

On the Balance Sheet, figures shown “As of July 31, 2010” are preliminary until the FY 09-10 year-
end closeout and audit are complete. At that point, final June 30, 2010 totals will be carried forward.
This is scheduled to take place at the end of October, with the November Treasurer’s Report being
the first month to reflect the final audited beginning balances for this fiscal year.

Total Assets are at approximately $25.2 million, up $8.7 million from last July. The largest
differences were comprised of an $11.0 million decrease in Short-term investments a $9.6 million
increase in Cash and cash equivalents, a $3.7 million increase in Accounts Receivable, and a
$6.6 million increase in Due from other Funds for a total net increase of $8.7 million. The
decrease in the Short-term investments is largely the result of our continued efforts to keep our
deposits fully insured. The $6.6 million increase in Due from other funds is a timing of payments
between inter-fund activities. The $3.7 million increase in Accounts Receivable is a direct result of
the increase in tuition and fees.

At roughly $5.6 million, Total Liabilities are down approximately $441 thousand from last year’s
July balance. The most significant changes were in the areas of Accounts payable, Accrued
payroll and related Liabilities, Accrued termination pay, and Deposits held for others. The
Accounts payable increase was largely due to a difference in the timing of the last end of year-check
runs between the two fiscal years and an invoice to E&L Construction for the library renovation.
The Accrued payroll and related liabilities decrease was due to the lack of a contingency payment
in the current year. The Accrued Termination Pay has not been adjusted as of yet from the
actuary, this will be done prior to the conclusion of the audit.

The College maintains one checking account for all of its funds; deposits and disbursements. This
necessitates the short-term “loaning” or “borrowing” between the funds throughout the year
depending on which funds revenue or expenditures are being deposited or paid out. Each month
the accounting department clears these “due to’s” and “due from’s” respectively assigning the
activity to the proper fund. However, significant activity can occur after these transfers are
completed, causing large variances when compared to the previous period. This is the case in the
current month and the reason for the $6.6 million increase in this inter-fund activity.

Comments on spending from other funds:

Of the roughly $3.8 million spent in the other funds, $1.5 million was expended out of the Agency
Scholarships, Federal Grants, and scholarships for grant activities and student scholarships,
$818 thousand out of the Maintenance and Replacement Fund and Bond Issue 2008 fund for
capital improvements, and $1.5 million out of the Debt Retirement Fund for regularly scheduled
principal and interest payments.



Mott Community College

General Fund

Statement of Revenues, Expenditures and Changes in Net Assets
For the 1 Month Ended July 31, 2010
With Comparative Totals at July 31, 2009

Revenues:

Tuition and fees
Property taxes
State appropriations
Ballenger trust
Grants and other

Total revenues

Expenditures:

Salaries and wages

Fringe benefits

Contracted senices
Materials and supplies
Facilities rent

Utilities and insurance
Operations/communications
Transfers

Capital outlay

Total expenditures

Net increase/(decrease) in net
assets

Actual to Actual to

FY 2010-2011 YTD Actuals YTD Actuals Actual $ Actual %

Budget as of 07/31/10 as of 07/31/09 Change Change
36,886,727 $ 9,891,113 $ 7,069,694 $ 2,821,419 39.91%
20,915,001 330,854 570,934 (240,080) -42.05%
14,530,349 - - - 0.00%
1,641,960 143,592 143,592 - 0.00%
1,700,491 36,193 31,107 5,086 16.35%
75,674,528 10,401,752 7,815,327 2,586,425 33.09%
40,420,694 2,030,729 2,050,275 (19,546) -0.95%
15,645,833 1,279,443 998,315 281,128 28.16%
5,830,930 102,787 187,891 (85,104) -45.29%
2,491,048 37,992 46,993 (9,001) -19.15%
216,400 25,360 37,833 (12,473) -32.97%
2,765,000 381,309 384,552 (3,243) -0.84%
5,581,902 678,159 350,679 327,480 93.38%
2,504,200 3,000 2,000 1,000 50.00%
172,370 10,210 1,426 8,784 615.99%
75,628,377 4,548,989 4,059,964 489,025 12.05%
46,151 5,852,763 3,755,363 2,097,400 55.85%



Mott Community College

General Fund
Balance Sheet
July 31, 2010

With Comparative Totals at July 31, 2009

Assets

Current Assets

Cash and cash equivalents

Short term investments

Due from (to) other funds

Accounts receivable - net of allowance
for uncollectible accounts ($2,700,907
for 2010 and $3,533,911 for 2009)

Inventories

Prepaid expenses and other assets

Total Assets

Liabilities and Net Assets

Current Liabilities
Accounts payable

Accrued payroll and related liabilities
Deposits held for others
Total Current Liabilities
Accrued termination pay

Total Liabilities

Net Assets
Unrestricted

Total Net Assets

Total Liabilities and Net Assets

As of As of
July 31 July 31 $

2010 2009 Change
13,009,625 $ 3,385,887 $ 9,623,738
936 11,299,492 (11,298,556)
1,545,245 (5,054,951) 6,600,196
9,093,266 5,380,986 3,712,280
72,039 44,724 27,315
132,749 118,824 13,925
25,218,988 $ 16,540,089 $ 8,678,899
1,025,585 $ 660,404 $ 365,181
1,712,359 2,069,764 (357,405)
91,921 188,237 (96,316)
2,829,865 2,918,405 (88,540)
2,731,114 3,084,006 (352,892)
5,560,979 6,002,411 (441,432)
19,658,009 10,537,678 9,120,331
19,658,009 10,537,678 9,120,331
25,218,988 $ 16,540,089 $ 8,678,899
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1.02  Custodial Services for Extension Campuses— Purchase Award

Mott Community College will be contracting with a vendor for a period of two years with an
optional one year renewal for the purpose of performing scheduled daily, weekly and annual
custodial services at the Southern Lakes Branch Center, Livingston Center, the Lapeer Extension
Center and the Workforce Development Center. The Purchasing Department, in collaboration with
Physical Plant Operations, will be contracting services from AYS Facilities Maintenance for each of
the four named buildings, following a competitive sealed proposal in which nine responses were
received and evaluated.

Based on the above information, the following resolution is recommended.

Be it Resolved, That

The Charles Stewart Mott Community College Board of Trustees
Awards the two [2] year contract for custodial services to AYS Facilities Maintenance,
G3080 N Center Road, Flint, Michigan, 48500, for an annual cost in the amount of
$88,581.60 [eighty-eight thousand five hundred eighty-one dollars and sixty cents].

Reviewed and Submitted by:

e
& I, Date: August 23, 2010
N

ins—Lto )

ent, Student & Administrative Services

Board Policy Statement Reference: 4410 — Purchasing

General: Purchases should be based on quality and price. Qualified vendors should have the opportunity to bid on
College purchases. This policy is established to ensure that sound business practices are followed in the purchase of
furnishings, equipment, materials, goods and supplies.



Custodial Services for Extension Campuses— Purchase Award

AYS Facilities Maintenance
G3080 N Center Road
Flint, Ml 48506

CMS Sourcing Solutions
29700 Harper Ave
St Clair Shores, M| 48082

Road Runr Maintenance
747 Orchard Lake Rd
Pontiac, M| 48341

Sterling Cleaning Services
1080 Naughton Dr
Troy, M|l 48083

Professional Building
Maintenance

23077 Greenfield Rd Ste 107
Southfield, MI 48075

E-Jan International
3800 Packard Rd Ste 220
Ann Arbor, M|l 48108

Anderson Janitorial Services
5439 Country Hearth Lane
Grand Blanc, M| 48439

Neat Street Cleaning Service
2685 Lapeer Road Ste 201
Auburn Hills, M| 48326

Seaway Building Services
458 Second St
Toledo, OH 43605

Bid Tabulation — Annual Cost
June 11, 2010 - 2:00 PM

10

Lapeer Livingston Workforce SLBC TOTAL
S 25,510 S 13,576 S 16,146 $ 33,350 $ 88,582
S 23,415 S 29,801 S 17,029 S 36,187 S 106,434
$ 33,300 S 36,312 S 33,300 S 46,800 S 149,712
S 40,036 S 42,089 S 25,228 S 54,885 S 162,238
S 47,102 S 48,134 S 30,353 S 62,750 S 188,338
S 61,878 S 85,084 S 40,607 S 104,421 $ 291,990
S 38,832 No Bid S 19,360 S 37,671
S 46,297 No Bid S 19,461 S 79,592
S 64,680 S 61,080 No Bid S 105,360
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1.03  Custodial Supplies — Purchase Award

Mott Community College will be contracting with several vendors for a period of two years with an
optional two year renewal for the purchase of custodial cleaning supplies. The Purchasing
Department, in collaboration with Physical Plant Operations, will be purchasing supplies from
Staples Advantage, Arnold Sales, and SupplyPro, following a competitive sealed proposal in which
ten responses were received and evaluated.

Based on the above information, the following resolution is recommended.
Be it Resolved, That
The Charles Stewart Mott Community College Board of Trustees

Awards two [2] year contracts for custodial supplies to the following vendors in the
following categories:

Garbage bags: SupplyPro, 7075 Dort Highway, Space 600, Grand Blanc, Michigan,
48439, for an estimated annual cost in the amount of $17,023.57 [seventeen
thousand twenty three dollars and fifty seven cents].

Paper products, scrubbing pads: Staples Advantage, 23300 Northwestern Highway,
Southfield, Michigan, 48075, for an estimated annual cost in the amount of
$49,030.34 [forty-nine thousand thirty dollars and thirty-four cents.

Chemicals and general supplies: Arnold Sales, 1218 North Lincoln Avenue, Bay
City, Michigan, 48108, for an estimated annual cost in the amount of $34,533.74
[thirty-four thousand five hundred thirty three dollars and seventy-four cents].

Reviewed and Submitted by

Date: August 23, 2010
o §\a)
ic Presldent Student & Administrative Services

Board Policy Statement Reference: 4410 — Purchasing

General: Purchases should be based on quality and price. Qualified vendors should have the opportunity to bid on
College purchases. This policy is established to ensure that sound business practices are followed in the purchase of
furnishings, equipment, materials, goods and supplies.




SupplyPro
7075 Dort Hwy, Space 600
Grand Blanc, M| 48439

Staples Advantage
23300 Northwestern Hwy
Southfield, Ml 48075

Arnold Sales
1218 N Lincoln Ave
Bay City, M148108

Hercules and Hercules
19055 W Davison
Detroit, M| 48223

Extreme Supplies
16017 Leone Dr
Macomb, MI 48042

HP Products
8652 Haggerty Rd, Ste 200
Belleville, Ml 48111

Colman Wolf Supply
15201 E 11 Mile Road
Roseville, M| 48066

Sun Valley Foods
14401 Dexter Ave
Detroit, MI 48238

Complete Supply Company
4032 Grandview Dr
Flushing, MI 48433

Harrington Associates
5537 Chicago Rd
Warren, Ml 48092

Custodial Supplies — Purchase Award
Bid Tabulation — Estimated Annual Cost

June 11, 2010 - 2:00 PM

12

Garbage Paper General Scrubbing
Bags Products Supplies Pads Chemicals
$17,023.57 DNMS $10,862.87 $2,216.55 $31,244.83
DNMS $46,986.24 $12,897.79 $2,044.10 DNFD
$26,883.38 DNMS $8,907.95 $2,268.66 $25,625.79
$17,819.60 $48,943.20 $12,026.46 $2,311.96 *$24,821.80
DNMS DNMS $10,761.71 $4,992.49 $28,908.96
DNMS **$45,575.11 $10,897.63 $2,517.94 $29,178.45
$27,671.19 $48,397.35 $12,340.85 $2,922.58 DNFD
$21,835.51 DNMS Incomplete No Bid No Bid
$17,131.38 $52,534.59 $15,082.39 $4,518.43 Incomplete
DNMS DNMS Incomplete No Bid DNMS



Definitions

DMNS — Does not match specification per Physical Plant Operations
DNFD — Does not fit our dispensers per Physical Plant Operations

*Bid would have required College to replace dispensers at an additional cost in each of the janitorial delivery
facilities (dugouts) and does not include delivery charges.

** Bid did not include delivery charges.

13



14

FOR ACTION
Board of Trustees
Charles Stewart Mott Community College
Regular Meeting, August 23, 2010
Volume 42
1.04  Approval of Administrative Support Collective Bargaining Agreement

Representatives of the College and the Administrative Support bargaining unit, affiliated with
Service Employees International Union Local 517M, reached tentative agreement on a collective
bargaining agreement (CBA) for the period covering March 31, 2009 through June 30, 2012. The
tentative agreement was approved by the unit’s membership and Management recommends Board
approval of the new labor agreement.

As you know, Management implemented its last best offer, effective March 31, 2009, when the
Union declared impasse. Since then, both the Union and College representatives have met with a
State mediator as directed by Fact Finder Betty Widgeon to reduce the number of issues for fact
finding. During mediation, both sides explored settlement options and ultimately identified a single
issue that, when resolved on August 2, 2010, enabled the Union to sign a tentative agreement
incorporating all of the items in Management’s last best offer and compromise language on the
single disputed item, scheduling and hours.

On the basis of the preceding information, the following resolution is recommended,
Be it Resolved, That
The Chatrles Stewart Mott Community College Board of Trustees

Approves the negotiated tentative agreement for the Administrative Support bargaining unit
through June 30, 2012, and further authorizes the President to execute the labor agreement.

Reviewed and Submitted by:

M—M
Date: August 23, 2010

Mark Kennedy, CHRO )

Board Policy Statement Reference: 5100 — Compensation and Benefits

1.
2.

Total compensation/benefits must not exceed 77% of the total operating budget.

The President is directed to review all budget proposals and labor agreements with specific emphasis on total
compensation and recommend only actions that fall within the 77% maximum and that will preserve the College’s long-
term fiscal stability.

Board Policy Statement Reference: 5300 - Recognition of Bargaining Units

1.

Board Negotiating Agents: The President will appoint bargaining teams to represent the College in negotiations. The
President, in consultation with the Executive Cabinet, will recommend broad, strategic bargaining objectives to the
Board at the beginning of bargaining.

Contract Approval: At the conclusion of contract bargaining, and following member ratification, the President must
present the proposed agreement to the Board for its consideration.



President’s Report
Regular Board of Trustees Meeting
August 23, 2010

1. Executive Summary

2. Introduction of New Hires

3. Upcoming Dates:

September 2, 2010 All-Employee Breakfast, 7:30 a.m., Sarvis Center

September 14, 2010 Don Riegle Community Service Awards, 5:30 p.m. @ the FIA

September 22, 2010 Finance/Audit Committee, 12:00 noon, CM1019
Personnel Committee, 4:00 p.m., CM1019

September 27, 2010 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

October 19-23, 2010 ACCT Leadership Congtress, Toronto

October 20, 2010 Finance/Audit Committee, 12:00 noon, CM1019
Personnel Committee, 4:00 p.m., CM1019

October 25, 2010 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

November 17, 2010 Finance/Audit Committee, 12:00 noon, CM1019
Personnel Committee, 4:00 p.m., CM1019

November 22, 2010 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

December 15, 2010 Finance/Audit Committee, 12:00 noon, CM1019
Personnel Committee, 4:00 p.m., CM1019

December 20, 2010 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

January 24, 2011 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

February 28, 2011 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

March 28, 2011 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

April 25, 2011 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

May 23, 2011 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café

June 27, 2011 Regular Board Meeting, Applewood Café
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